
Genesis 1:1 - In the beginning
God created the heavens and the
earth.

Hebrews 13:8
- Jesus Christ is the same
yesterday and today and forever.

1 Peter 1:16 -
For it is written: "Be holy, because
I am holy."

John 1:1 - In
the beginning was the Word, and
the Word was with God, and the
Word was God.

John 1:14 - The Word became
flesh and made his dwelling
among us. We have seen his
glory, the glory of the One and
Only, who came from the Father,
full of grace and truth.

John 3:16 - For God so loved the
world that he gave his one and
only Son, that whoever believes
in him shall not perish but have
eternal life.

James 1:22 - Do not merely listen
to the word, and so deceive
yourselves. Do what it says.

Psalms 90:2 -
Before the mountains were born or
you brought forth the earth and the
world, from everlasting to
everlasting you are God.

Romans 6:23 - For the wages of
sin is death, but the gift of God is
eternal life in Christ Jesus our
Lord.

Romans 5:8 -
But God demonstrates his own
love for us in this: While we were
still sinners, Christ died for us.

Romans 10:13 - For, "Everyone
who calls on the name of the Lord
will be saved."

Philippians 4:13
- I can do everything through Christ
who gives me strength.
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